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The most celebrated book of the 20th century is now a major motion picture.

This absorbing guide to the mind behind Middle-earth will introduce or remind readers of the abundance that
exists in Tolkien's thought and imagination. Interweaving sections explore The Lord of the Rings and its
history; the key themes, concepts and images in Tolkien's work; the people, and places in his life, and his
other writings. At the heart of the book is an indispensable A-Z of Middle-earth, with detailed entries on
Beings, Places, Things and Events.

Readers will also be introduced to Tolkien's deeply spiritual message, which was of great importance in his
creation of Middle-earth.

Central to Tolkien's fiction, as Colin Duriez points out, is the creation of elves. These are representative of
human spirituality and culture, and human spirituality itself has an elven quality. Just like C. S. Lewis, his
close friend, Tolkien was deeply inspired by a broad range of spiritual and philosophical imagery, like trees,
angels, the fall of humankind, the power of healing, the personification of wisdom, light and darkness, nature
and grace, and the metaphysical portrayal of heroism and evil.

"A welcome addition to any Tolkien reader's bookshelf. It is impossible to read Colin Duriez's volume
without wanting to reread Tolkien's books-an undoubted compliment to both authors." -Brian Sibley, author
of 'The Lord of the Rings' Official Movie Guide
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From reader reviews:

Pearlie Henry:

Information is provisions for folks to get better life, information these days can get by anyone from
everywhere. The information can be a understanding or any news even a problem. What people must be
consider while those information which is in the former life are difficult to be find than now is taking
seriously which one is appropriate to believe or which one the actual resource are convinced. If you receive
the unstable resource then you obtain it as your main information you will have huge disadvantage for you.
All those possibilities will not happen with you if you take Tolkien and the Lord of the Rings: A Guide to
Middle-Earth as the daily resource information.

Rita Carter:

The particular book Tolkien and the Lord of the Rings: A Guide to Middle-Earth will bring you to the new
experience of reading any book. The author style to describe the idea is very unique. In case you try to find
new book to see, this book very acceptable to you. The book Tolkien and the Lord of the Rings: A Guide to
Middle-Earth is much recommended to you to learn. You can also get the e-book through the official web
site, so you can quickly to read the book.

Walter Knight:

Reading a book to become new life style in this season; every people loves to read a book. When you read a
book you can get a wide range of benefit. When you read ebooks, you can improve your knowledge, since
book has a lot of information in it. The information that you will get depend on what types of book that you
have read. If you wish to get information about your study, you can read education books, but if you want to
entertain yourself look for a fiction books, this sort of us novel, comics, in addition to soon. The Tolkien and
the Lord of the Rings: A Guide to Middle-Earth provide you with new experience in reading through a book.

Jackie Thompson:

As we know that book is essential thing to add our information for everything. By a guide we can know
everything we would like. A book is a list of written, printed, illustrated or perhaps blank sheet. Every year
seemed to be exactly added. This book Tolkien and the Lord of the Rings: A Guide to Middle-Earth was
filled concerning science. Spend your spare time to add your knowledge about your scientific disciplines
competence. Some people has diverse feel when they reading some sort of book. If you know how big
benefit of a book, you can feel enjoy to read a book. In the modern era like today, many ways to get book
that you just wanted.
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