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There is plenty of creativity within the international graffiti and street art scene. Writing text messages in
public spaces has been a unique art form and a means of communication between humans for over 30,000
years. Many street artists work only with text, written messages or poems, and not necessarily only with
colourful murals, styles, tags and logos. Street Messages is the first publication that delivers a deep insight
into this literary form of expression in the world of global street art. We are confronted with a vast amount of
written information in the form of advertising and street or shop signs every single day of our lives. Reading
and decoding this information has become a daily routine. Apart from the texts that are trying to sell us
something or direct us somewhere, the streets are full of artistic and poetic forms of expression – messages
written by graffiti and street artists. Street Messages offers a historic background to written messages in
public spaces and introduces more than 80 artists from across the world who work exclusively or partly with
text. The vast body of information and numerous exclusive quotes and words of wisdom makes Street
Messages the first book to shed some light on this as yet undocumented form of street art culture. Features
artwork by Banksy, Dolk, Ben Eine, Faith 47, Flint…, Kid Acne, Know Hope, Mobstr, Skki and many
others.
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From reader reviews:

Walter Johnson:

Book is to be different for every grade. Book for children till adult are different content. As it is known to us
that book is very important normally. The book STREET MESSAGES was making you to know about other
know-how and of course you can take more information. It is extremely advantages for you. The reserve
STREET MESSAGES is not only giving you much more new information but also to get your friend when
you feel bored. You can spend your current spend time to read your guide. Try to make relationship while
using book STREET MESSAGES. You never sense lose out for everything if you read some books.

Earl Diehl:

In this time globalization it is important to someone to find information. The information will make a
professional understand the condition of the world. The fitness of the world makes the information much
easier to share. You can find a lot of references to get information example: internet, magazine, book, and
soon. You can observe that now, a lot of publisher that will print many kinds of book. The particular book
that recommended to your account is STREET MESSAGES this guide consist a lot of the information from
the condition of this world now. This particular book was represented so why is the world has grown up. The
language styles that writer value to explain it is easy to understand. Often the writer made some analysis
when he makes this book. Here is why this book suitable all of you.

James Martin:

Is it an individual who having spare time in that case spend it whole day by watching television programs or
just laying on the bed? Do you need something new? This STREET MESSAGES can be the answer, oh how
comes? A book you know. You are therefore out of date, spending your time by reading in this new era is
common not a nerd activity. So what these books have than the others?

Francis Lopez:

As a university student exactly feel bored to be able to reading. If their teacher questioned them to go to the
library or even make summary for some book, they are complained. Just very little students that has reading's
heart or real their pastime. They just do what the educator want, like asked to the library. They go to there
but nothing reading very seriously. Any students feel that looking at is not important, boring and can't see
colorful images on there. Yeah, it is to be complicated. Book is very important to suit your needs. As we
know that on this period, many ways to get whatever you want. Likewise word says, ways to reach Chinese's
country. Therefore this STREET MESSAGES can make you sense more interested to read.
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