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Graham Hancock's multimillion best seller Fingerprints of the Gods remains an astonishing, deeply
controversial, wide-ranging investigation of the mysteries of our past and the evidence for Earth's lost
civilization. Twenty years on, Hancock returns with the sequel to his seminal work filled with completely
new scientific and archaeological evidence which has only recently come to light....

Near the end of the last Ice Age 12,800 years ago, a giant comet that had entered the solar system from deep
space thousands of years earlier broke into multiple fragments. Some of these struck the Earth, causing a
global cataclysm on a scale unseen since the extinction of the dinosaurs. At least eight of the fragments hit
the North American ice cap while further fragments hit the Northern European ice cap. The impacts, from
comet fragments a mile wide approaching at more than 60,000 miles an hour, generated huge amounts of
heat which instantly liquidized millions of square kilometers of ice, destabilizing the Earth's crust and
causing the global deluge that is remembered in myths all around the world.

A second series of impacts, equally devastating, causing further cataclysmic flooding, occurred 11,600 years
ago, the exact date that Plato gave for the destruction and submergence of Atlantis. The evidence revealed in
this book shows beyond reasonable doubt that an advanced civilization that flourished during the Ice Age
was destroyed in the global cataclysms between 12,800 and 11,600 years ago. But there were survivors -
known to later cultures by names such as 'the Sages', 'the Magicians', 'the Shining Ones', and 'the Mystery
Teachers of Heaven'. They travelled the world in their great ships, doing all in their power to keep the spark
of civilization burning. They settled at key locations - Gobekli Tepe in Turkey, Baalbek in Lebanon, Giza in
Egypt, ancient Sumer, Mexico, Peru, and across the Pacific, where a huge pyramid has recently been
discovered in Indonesia.

Everywhere they went these 'Magicians of the Gods' brought with them the memory of a time when mankind
had fallen out of harmony with the universe and paid a heavy price. A memory and a warning to the future...

For the comet that wrought such destruction between 12,800 and 11,600 years may not be done with us yet.
Astronomers believe that a 20-mile wide 'dark' fragment of the original giant comet remains hidden within its
debris stream and threatens the Earth. An astronomical message encoded at Gobekli Tepe, and in the Sphinx
and the pyramids of Egypt, warns that the 'Great Return' will occur in our time....
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From reader reviews:

Stevie Mozingo:

Reading a publication tends to be new life style within this era globalization. With studying you can get a lot
of information that may give you benefit in your life. Along with book everyone in this world may share
their idea. Guides can also inspire a lot of people. Many author can inspire their particular reader with their
story or perhaps their experience. Not only the storyplot that share in the textbooks. But also they write about
the data about something that you need instance. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach your
children, there are many kinds of book which exist now. The authors on earth always try to improve their
proficiency in writing, they also doing some exploration before they write to the book. One of them is this
Magicians of the Gods.

Amanda Kline:

People live in this new day of lifestyle always make an effort to and must have the extra time or they will get
wide range of stress from both way of life and work. So , if we ask do people have free time, we will say
absolutely sure. People is human not really a robot. Then we request again, what kind of activity are you
experiencing when the spare time coming to you actually of course your answer will unlimited right. Then
do you try this one, reading guides. It can be your alternative within spending your spare time, the particular
book you have read is usually Magicians of the Gods.

Lillian Vaughn:

With this era which is the greater person or who has ability to do something more are more important than
other. Do you want to become one among it? It is just simple solution to have that. What you have to do is
just spending your time almost no but quite enough to get a look at some books. One of the books in the top
checklist in your reading list is actually Magicians of the Gods. This book which can be qualified as The
Hungry Mountains can get you closer in turning into precious person. By looking upward and review this
publication you can get many advantages.

Harvey Lee:

Reserve is one of source of information. We can add our understanding from it. Not only for students and
also native or citizen require book to know the revise information of year to help year. As we know those
publications have many advantages. Beside we all add our knowledge, can bring us to around the world. By
the book Magicians of the Gods we can acquire more advantage. Don't you to be creative people? For being
creative person must love to read a book. Just choose the best book that ideal with your aim. Don't always be
doubt to change your life at this time book Magicians of the Gods. You can more appealing than now.
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