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The face of terror is hard to recognize—especially when it’s homegrown.

Blair Powell is set to join her father on the campaign trail even though a domestic terrorist group has already
launched one attack on President Andrew Powell's life. The orchestrators of the assassination attempt are still
at large, and Andrew's opponent is a popular ultra-conservative with questionable ties to the radical right.
Blair's wife, DHS Deputy Director Cameron Roberts has been charged with the task of tracking down those
responsible for the attack, while secretly searching for proof that a powerful senator is involved in treason.
Cam has an ace in the hole no one knows about, however—an agent deep undercover in the stronghold of a
radical militia group, FBI SA Loren McElroy. Cam's biggest challenge is running the terrorists to ground
without getting McElroy and her renegade handler, Skylar Dunbar, killed in the cross fire.

The Honor series.
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From reader reviews:

Charles Cushman:

The book Code of Honor can give more knowledge and information about everything you want. Why then
must we leave the best thing like a book Code of Honor? A few of you have a different opinion about
reserve. But one aim that will book can give many facts for us. It is absolutely proper. Right now, try to
closer along with your book. Knowledge or data that you take for that, you could give for each other; you
may share all of these. Book Code of Honor has simple shape however you know: it has great and massive
function for you. You can appear the enormous world by available and read a book. So it is very wonderful.

Glenn Flinchum:

The actual book Code of Honor will bring you to definitely the new experience of reading the book. The
author style to clarify the idea is very unique. In the event you try to find new book you just read, this book
very suitable to you. The book Code of Honor is much recommended to you to learn. You can also get the e-
book in the official web site, so you can more easily to read the book.

Agnes Shivers:

Reading can called thoughts hangout, why? Because when you are reading a book specifically book entitled
Code of Honor your head will drift away trough every dimension, wandering in every aspect that maybe
unfamiliar for but surely will become your mind friends. Imaging every word written in a book then become
one contact form conclusion and explanation which maybe you never get ahead of. The Code of Honor
giving you another experience more than blown away your mind but also giving you useful details for your
better life with this era. So now let us explain to you the relaxing pattern this is your body and mind is going
to be pleased when you are finished reading through it, like winning a sport. Do you want to try this
extraordinary wasting spare time activity?

Paul Jones:

Many people spending their period by playing outside with friends, fun activity along with family or just
watching TV 24 hours a day. You can have new activity to spend your whole day by studying a book. Ugh,
you think reading a book really can hard because you have to accept the book everywhere? It fine you can
have the e-book, bringing everywhere you want in your Mobile phone. Like Code of Honor which is keeping
the e-book version. So , try out this book? Let's see.
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