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When Ruby woke up on her tenth birthday, something about her had changed. Something alarming enough
to make her parents lock her in the garage and call the police. Something that gets her sent to Thurmond, a
brutal government "rehabilitation camp." She might have survived the mysterious disease that's killed most
of America's children, but she and the others have emerged with something far worse: frightening abilities
they cannot control.

Now sixteen, Ruby is one of the dangerous ones.

When the truth comes out, Ruby barely escapes Thurmond with her life. Now she's on the run, desperate to
find the one safe haven left for kids like her-East River. She joins a group of kids who escaped their own
camp. Liam, their brave leader, is falling hard for Ruby. But no matter how much she aches for him, Ruby
can't risk getting close. Not after what happened to her parents.

When they arrive at East River, nothing is as it seems, least of all its mysterious leader. But there are other
forces at work, people who will stop at nothing to use Ruby in their fight against the government. Ruby will
be faced with a terrible choice, one that may mean giving up her only chance at a life worth living.
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From reader reviews:

Joey Mendoza:

Book is to be different for each grade. Book for children right up until adult are different content. As you
may know that book is very important for all of us. The book The Darkest Minds (A Darkest Minds Novel)
was making you to know about other know-how and of course you can take more information. It is quite
advantages for you. The guide The Darkest Minds (A Darkest Minds Novel) is not only giving you much
more new information but also to get your friend when you experience bored. You can spend your personal
spend time to read your guide. Try to make relationship with all the book The Darkest Minds (A Darkest
Minds Novel). You never truly feel lose out for everything in case you read some books.

James McNally:

The e-book untitled The Darkest Minds (A Darkest Minds Novel) is the guide that recommended to you you
just read. You can see the quality of the e-book content that will be shown to an individual. The language
that creator use to explained their ideas are easily to understand. The copy writer was did a lot of
investigation when write the book, so the information that they share to you is absolutely accurate. You also
will get the e-book of The Darkest Minds (A Darkest Minds Novel) from the publisher to make you much
more enjoy free time.

Kisha Hutton:

Often the book The Darkest Minds (A Darkest Minds Novel) has a lot details on it. So when you read this
book you can get a lot of advantage. The book was authored by the very famous author. The writer makes
some research previous to write this book. This particular book very easy to read you can obtain the point
easily after scanning this book.

Keely Charles:

Playing with family in the park, coming to see the water world or hanging out with friends is thing that
usually you might have done when you have spare time, in that case why you don't try matter that really
opposite from that. Just one activity that make you not experience tired but still relaxing, trilling like on
roller coaster you are ride on and with addition of information. Even you love The Darkest Minds (A Darkest
Minds Novel), you are able to enjoy both. It is very good combination right, you still want to miss it? What
kind of hang-out type is it? Oh occur its mind hangout men. What? Still don't have it, oh come on its
identified as reading friends.
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