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Landon Brinkley’s dreams are all coming true. She’s landed an internship with the fabulous Selah Smith,
event planner for the Hollywood elite, taking her from small-town Texas to the bright lights of LA. Landon
soon finds herself in a world in which spending a million dollars on an event—even a child’s birthday
party—is de rigueur and the whims of celebrity clients are life-and-death matters. At first, the thrill of
working on A-list parties and celebrity weddings is enough to get Landon through the seventy-five-hour
workweeks and endless abuse at the hands of her mercurial boss. But when the reality of the business reveals
itself, she’s forced to make a choice: do whatever it takes to get ahead, or stay true to herself.

Drawing on the author’s real-life experiences as an event planner to the stars, Party Girl takes readers on an
adventure among Hollywood’s most beautiful—and most outrageous—people, revealing the ugly side of
Hollywood’s prettiest parties.

Revised edition: This edition of Party Girl includes editorial revisions.
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From reader reviews:

Alberta Smith:

Have you spare time to get a day? What do you do when you have more or little spare time? Yes, you can
choose the suitable activity with regard to spend your time. Any person spent their own spare time to take a
wander, shopping, or went to the particular Mall. How about open or perhaps read a book entitled Party Girl?
Maybe it is to get best activity for you. You already know beside you can spend your time with your
favorite's book, you can more intelligent than before. Do you agree with their opinion or you have other
opinion?

Joshua Montgomery:

Playing with family in a very park, coming to see the water world or hanging out with pals is thing that
usually you will have done when you have spare time, subsequently why you don't try issue that really
opposite from that. One activity that make you not experiencing tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller
coaster you are ride on and with addition of knowledge. Even you love Party Girl, you could enjoy both. It is
very good combination right, you still desire to miss it? What kind of hang-out type is it? Oh can happen its
mind hangout folks. What? Still don't obtain it, oh come on its identified as reading friends.

Timothy Brown:

You can spend your free time to study this book this book. This Party Girl is simple to develop you can read
it in the park your car, in the beach, train and also soon. If you did not have much space to bring typically the
printed book, you can buy often the e-book. It is make you much easier to read it. You can save often the
book in your smart phone. Thus there are a lot of benefits that you will get when you buy this book.

Rosa Felton:

Do you like reading a book? Confuse to looking for your selected book? Or your book has been rare? Why
so many question for the book? But virtually any people feel that they enjoy intended for reading. Some
people likes reading, not only science book but novel and Party Girl or perhaps others sources were given
information for you. After you know how the truly great a book, you feel desire to read more and more.
Science guide was created for teacher or students especially. Those guides are helping them to increase their
knowledge. In different case, beside science e-book, any other book likes Party Girl to make your spare time
a lot more colorful. Many types of book like here.
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